Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021
Proposed Amendments (added text to the code is: underlined, deleted text to the code is: struck-threugh)
AC
ITEM NUMBER ARTICLE SUMMARY PROPONENT TIO
N
ERB — Task Force
IECC -2022-1 R402 /N1102 | Add new Section R402.1.2.1 Indirectly conditioned attics to read as follows. David Goulding,
Ensign Building
R402.1.2.1 (N1102.1.2.1) Indirectly conditioned attics. Solutions; Joel
Rodriguez, Gwinnett
Where table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) requires R-38 or Table N1102.1.4 (R402.1.4) requires a U- County; Lucas
factor of 0.030, an air impermeable insulation installed to the underside or directly above the roof | Lauritzen, Meritage
deck with a U-factor of 0.05 or R-value of R-20 shall be deemed equivalent to the provisions in Homes; Randy
N1102.2.1 (R402.2.1), with the following requirements: Nicklas, Icynene-
Lapolla; Mike
1. The house shall attain a blower door test result <3 ACHS50 Barcik, Southface
Institute; Phil Brown,
2. The house shall require a whole house mechanical ventilation system that does not solely | Compton Sales
rely on a negative pressure strategy (must be positive, balanced or hybrid) A
3. Where insulation is installed below the roof deck and the exposed portion of roof rafters
are not already covered by the R-20 depth of the air-impermeable insulation, the exposed
portion of the roof rafters shall be wrapped (covered) by minimum R-3 unless directly
covered by drywall / finished ceiling. Roof rafters are not required to be covered by
minimum r-3 if a continuous insulation is installed above the roof deck.
4. Indoor heating, cooling, and ventilation equipment including ductwork, shall be inside the
building thermal envelope.
*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 1 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds
60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021

IRC -2022-2 M1502.3.1 Add new sentence to Section M1502.3.1 ‘Exhaust termination outlet and passageway size.” to read | Anthony Drake
as follows:

Dryer duct termination shall be 2 inches above the finished grade and 10 feet away from condenser
unit.

?IMC/IRC?-2022 -3 1.1 or1.2? Code Change or Amendment to prohibit installation of air handing equipment in unconditioned Tim Coombs
spaces IE attics in specifically South Georgia where attic temperatures reach 150 degrees.

IRC-2022-4 M1402.1 Revise section M1402.1 ‘General.’ to read as follows: Robert Glass

Oil-fired central furnaces shall conform to ANSI/UL 727. Electric furnaces shall conform to UL D
1995 or UL/CSA 60335-2-40.

IRC-2022-5 M1403.1 Revise section M1403.1 ‘Heat pumps’ to read as follows: Robert Glass

Electric heat pumps shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 1995 or UL/CSA/ANCE D
60335-2-40

IRC-2022-6 M1412.1 Revise section ‘M 1412.1 Approval of equipment’ to read as follows: Robert Glass

Absorption systems shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions. D
Absorption equipment shall comply with UL 1995 or UL/CSA/ANEE 60335-2-40.

IRC-2022-7 M1413.1 Revise section M1413.1 ‘General.’ to read as follows: Robert Glass

Evaporative cooling equipment and appliances shall comply with UL 1995 or UL/CSA/ANCE D
60335-2-40 and shall be installed:

IRC-2022-8 M2006.1 Revise section M2006.1 ‘General.’ to read as follows: Robert Glass

Pool and spa heaters shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation D
instructions. Oil fired pool heaters shall comply with UL726. Electric pool & spa heaters shall
comply with UL 1261. Pool and spa heat pump water heaters shall comply with UL 1995, e CSA

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 2 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS

60 Executive Park South, N.E.

Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231

2022 Code Amendments
Sub Committee

DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds
Phone: (404) 679-3104
Date Revised: 5/27/2021

C22.2 No. 236 or UL/CSA 60335-2-40.

IRC -2022 -9 Chapter44

Revise Chapter 44 Reference Standards to read as follows:

Safoty ’e“.{e;use}*ls. td &Hdsmlﬁa* ]EREF*I*.Z’"pﬁhaﬂees Part2-40: Particular Requirements for

ASHRAE

ASHRAE
1791 Tullie Circle NE Atlanta, GA 30329

34—2046 2019:
Designation and Safety Classification of Refrigerants
M1411.1

CSA

Robert Glass

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs.

Page 3 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs
60 Executive Park South, N.E.

Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231

PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS
2022 Code Amendments
Sub Committee

DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds
Phone: (404) 679-3104
Date Revised: 5/27/2021

CSA Group
8501 East Pleasant Valley Road Cleveland, OH 44131- 5516

CAN/CSA/C22.2 No.
60335-2-40—206422019

Safety of Household and Similar
Electrical Appliances, Part 2-40: Particular Requirements for Electrical Heat Pumps, Air-
Conditioners and Dehumidifiers

M1402.1, M1403.1,
M1412.1, M1413.1, M2006.1

UL

UL LLC

333 Pfingsten Road
Northbrook, IL 60062

1995—20H2015

Heating and Cooling Equipment

—withrevisions-threughJuly 2015

M1402.1, M1403.1,
M1407.1, M1412.1, M1413.1, M2006.1

UL/CSAAANCE 60335-2-40—
20422019

Standard for Household and Similar Electrical Appliances — Safety -, Part 2-40: Particular
Requirements for Meter eempressers Electrical Heat Pumps, Air-Conditioners and Dehumidifiers

M1402.1, M1403.1, M1412.1, M1413.1, M2006.1

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs.

Page 4 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021
IEBC -2022-10 All The 2018 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) with Georgia amendments has been AIA

adopted by the Georgia DCA as a permissive code. We propose adopting the 2018 IEBC with
Georgia amendments as a mandatory code.

IBC -2022-11 602.1.2 Add new section 602.1.2 ‘Alternative mass timber provisions (Appendix P)’ to read as follows: Legislature

602.1.2 Alternative mass timber provisions (Appendix P). As an alternative to the construction
types defined in 602.2 through 602.5, buildings and structures erected or to be erected, altered or
extended in height or area may-be shall be permitted to be classified as construction Type IV-A, A
IV-B or IV-C in accordance with Appendix P. Buildings and structures classified as IV-A, IV-B,
and IV-C shall comply with the provisions of Appendix P, as well as all other applicable provisions
of this code, including provisions for buildings of Type IV construction.

IBC -2022 - 12 Table 1705.3 | Revise Table 1705.3 Required Special Inspections and Tests of Concrete Construction to read as Jimmy Cotty,
follows: Georgia Ready
Mixed Concrete A
A revised table is attached. Association
IBC -2022-13 1705.3 Add new section 1705.3.3 ‘Testing Agency’ to read as follows: Jimmy Cotty,
Georgia Ready
1705.3.3 Testing Agency Mixed Concrete A
The testing agency performing acceptance testing shall comply with ASTM C1077. Association
IBC -2022 - 14 Chapter 17 Add new Table 1704.2 ‘Minimum Special Inspector Qualifications’ to read as follows: Jimmy Cotty,
Special Georgia Ready
Inspections The table is attached. Mixed Concrete A
Association
IBC -2022-15 903 Revise section 903.3.1.2 “NFPA 13R Sprinkler Systems’ to read as follows: Jimmy Cotty,
Georgia Ready
Automatlc sprrnkler systems in Group R occupan01es up—toaﬂd—memdmg—feur—stoﬁes—m—herght—m Mixed Concrete W

0 3 : ane shall be permitted to be Association
1nsta11ed throughout in accordance w1th NFPA 13R where the Group R occupancy meets all of the
following conditions:

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 5 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds
60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021

1. Four stories or less above grade plane.

2. The floor level of the highest story is 30 feet (9114 mm) or less above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

3. The floor level of the lowest story is 30 feet (9114 mm) or less below the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

The number of stories of Group R occupancies constructed in accordance with Sections 510.2 and

510.4 shall be measured from the herizental-assembly-ereating separate-buildings grade plane.

IBC -2022 - 16 510 Revise section 510.4 ‘Parking Beneath Group R’ to read as follows: Jimmy Cotty,
Georgia Ready
Where a maximum one story above grade plane Group S-2 parking garage, enclosed or open, or Mixed Concrete
combination thereof, of Type I construction or open of Type IV construction, with grade entrance, | Association
is provided under a building of Group R, the number of stories to be used in determining the W
minimum type of construction shall be measured from the fleerabeve-such-aparkingarea grade
plane. The floor assembly between the parking garage and the Group R above shall comply with
the type of construction required for the parking garage and shall also provide a fire-resistance
rating not less than the mixed occupancy separation required in Section 508.4.
IECC -2022 -17 R402.2.9 Georgia Structural
Add new section: R402.2.11.1 to Georgia State Amendments to the International Energy Pest Control
Conservation Code — 2015 edition to read as follows: Commission
R402.2.11 - Crawl Space Walls
R402.2.11.1:
Insulation provided at the interior rim joist area shall be removable to allow access for pest control
inspections.
A

Add new section to: R402.2.9.1 Rim Joist Insulation to read as follows.

R402.2.9 - Basement Walls
Propose to add - R402.2.9.1 Rim Joist Insulation:
Insulation provided at the interior rim joist area shall be removable to allow access for pest control

inspections.

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 6 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021
IRC -2022 - 18 R318 SECTION R318 PROTECTION AGAINST SUBTERRANEAN TERMITES American Chemistry
Council-Center for
R318.1 Subterranean termite control methods. the Polyurethanes
In areas subject to damage from termites as indicated by Table R301.2(1), protection shall be by Industry Spray Foam
one, or a combination, of the following methods: Coalition

1. Chemical termiticide treatment in accordance with Section R318.2.

Termite-baiting system installed and maintained in accordance with the label.
Pressure-preservative-treated wood in accordance with the provisions of Section R317.1
Naturally durable termite-resistant wood.

Physical barriers in accordance with Section R318.3 and used in locations as specified
in Section R317.1.

6. Cold-formed steel framing in accordance with Sections R505.2.1 and R603.2.1.

nbk v

R318.1.1  Quality Mark.

Lumber and plywood required to be pressure-preservative treated in accordance with Section
R318.1 shall bear the quality mark of an approved inspection agency that maintains continuing
supervision, testing and inspection over the quality of the product and that has been approved
by an accreditation body that complies with the requirements of the American Lumber D
Standard Committee treated wood program.

R318.1.2  Field treatment.
Field-cut ends, notches and drilled holes of pressure-preservative-treated wood shall be
retreated in the field in accordance with AWPA M4.

R318.2 Chemical termiticide treatment.

Chemical termiticide treatment shall include soil treatment, er field-applied, or factory applied
wood treatment. The concentration, rate of application and method of treatment of the chemical
termiticide shall be in strict accordance with the termiticide label and manufacturer’s instructions.

R318.3 Barriers.

Where used, Aapproved physical barriers, such as metal or plastic sheeting or composite sheeting
or collars specifically designed for termite prevention, shall be located below the lowest point of
untreated wood materials in the structure. Such materials shall be installed in a manner that
provides a continuous barrier, extending through all layers of the wall and projecting outward a
minimum of % inch, to force termites to pass around the barrier or shield thereby becoming visible

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 7 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)


https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch03_SecR301.2_TblR301.2_1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch03_SecR318.2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch03_SecR317.1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch03_SecR318.3
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch03_SecR317.1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch05_SecR505.2.1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/lookup/IRCComm2018_Pt03_Ch06_SecR603.2.1

Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

60 Executive Park South, N.E.
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231

2022 Code Amendments
Sub Committee

Phone: (404) 679-3104
Date Revised: 5/27/2021

to prevent termites from entering the structure without detection by visual inspection. installedin-a

R318.4 Foam plastic insulation protection.

In areas where the probability of termite infestation is “very heavy” as indicated in Figure
R301.2(7), foam plastic insulation shall be installed accordance with Section R318.4.1 or Section
R318.4.2, and Section R318.4.3 as applicable.

R318.4.1 Foam plastic insulation without advanced termite protection. Foam plastics

shall be permitted to be installed on the interior side of the foundation wall using the following

criteria:

1. The clearance between foam plastics on the foundation wall installed above grade and
exposed earth shall be not less than 6 inches (76 mm).

2. The clearance between foam plastic insulation and the top of the foundation wall shall not
be less than 3 inches (76 mm).

3. Insulation installed in the framing foundation interface shall be removable.

R318.4.2 Foam plastic insulation installed with advanced termite protection. Foam

plastic insulation shall be permitted to be installed to the interior side of the foundation wall

1.

2.

3.

4.

and at the framing foundation interface using the following criteria:

The clearance between foam plastic insulation on the foundation wall installed above
grade and exposed earth shall be not less than 6 inches (76 mm).

A termite barrier or shield shall extend continuously through the foundation and through
the insulation in accordance with Section R318.3.

The sill plate and rim/header joist shall be preservative treated in accordance with Section
R317 or shall have a field-applied treatment in accordance with R318.2.

In addition to the termite barrier or shield, the interior edge of the sill plate shall remain
exposed for visual inspection.

R318.4.3Foam Plastics installed below grade or below slab. Where foam plastic insulation is

used below grade or is concealed underneath the foundation or slab on grade floor, the insulation

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs.

Page 8 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS

60 Executive Park South, N.E.
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231

2022 Code Amendments
Sub Committee

DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

Phone: (404) 679-3104
Date Revised: 5/27/2021

material shall be protected against termite damage by treating the adjacent soil in accordance with
R318.1.1 or by use of an approved termite-resistant insulation material. Foam plastic insulation

shall not be applied to the exterior of the foundation wall.

Exceptions:

1.Buildings where the structural members of walls, floors, ceilings and roofs are entirely of
noncombustible materials or pressure-preservative-treated wood.

2.-3. On the interior side of basement walls.

IECC -

2022 -19

Ga
Amendment

to R402.2.11

Revise Ga Amendment to R402.2.11 in the IECC 2015 to read as follows:
R402.2.11 Crawl space walls.

As an alternative to insulating floors over crawl spaces, crawl space walls shall be
permitted to be insulated when the crawl space is not vented to the outside. Crawl space
wall insulation shall be permanently fastened to the wall and extend downward from the
floor to Wlthln 9 inches (229 mm) of the ﬁnlshed 1nter10r grade adjacent to the foundation
Wall A % mmeae e he 9 o
piﬁeﬁded—te-peﬂmt—mspee&eﬁs—fer—teemﬁes— Exposed earth in unvented crawl space
foundations shall be covered with a continuous Class 1 vapor retarder in accordance with
the International Building Code. All joints of the vapor retarder shall overlap by 6 inches
(152 mm) and be sealed or taped. The edges of the vapor retarder shall extend at least 6
inches (152 mm) up the stem wall and shall be attached and sealed to the stem wall.

American Chemistry
Council-Center for
the Polyurethanes
Industry Spray Foam
Coalition

*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs.

Page 9 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



Georgia Department of Community Affairs PROPOSED CODE AMENDMENTS DCA Staff: Jimmy Reynolds

60 Executive Park South, N.E. 2022 Code Amendments Phone: (404) 679-3104
Atlanta, Georgia 30329-2231 Sub Committee Date Revised: 5/27/2021
Insulation shall be installed in accordance with the termite provisions in R318.
IBC —2022- 20 In Chapter 35, Referenced Standards, GRMCA proposes to amend the referenced ASTM standards | John Hutton, Jimmy
by adding: Cotty, Georgia Ready
Mixed Concrete
ASTM C1077-17 — Standard Practice for Agencies Testing Concrete and Concrete Aggregates for | Association A
Use in Construction and Criteria for Testing Agency Evaluation
1705.3.3
*Note: These amendments are “proposed only” and have not been adopted by the Department of Community Affairs. Page 10 of 10

ACTION: A (Approve as Submitted); R (Approve as Revised); D (Disapprove); W (Withdrawn); CF (Carry Forward)



S DIGITAL 2018 International Building Code
AWMWNNN CODES Fourth Printing: Jan 2020
[ 1.1\
CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS ANDTESTS
TABLE 1705.3
REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION
CONTIN
uous PERIODIC REFERENCED IBC
TYPE SPECIAL [SPECIAL STANDARD? REFERENCE
INSPEC |INSPECTION
TION
1. Inspect reinforcement, including prestressing ACI 318: Ch. 20,
. 4 — X 25.2, 25.3, 26.6.1- |1908.4
tendons, and verify placement.
26.6.3
2. Reinforcing bar welding: — X
a. Verify weldability of reinforcing bars other than X
ASTM A706; AWS D1.4 _
b. Inspect single-pass fillet welds, maximum >/16”; and ACI 318: 26.6.4
c. Inspect all other welds. X
3. Inspect anchors cast in concrete. — X ACI 318: 17.8.2 —
4. Inspect anchors post-installed in hardened concrete ACI 318: 17.8.2.4
members.P
a. Adhesive anchors installed in horizontally or
upwardly inclined orientations to resist sustained X _
tension loads.
b. Mechanical anchors and adhesive anchors not
defined in 4.a. X ACI 318: 17.8.2
. 1904.1,
5. Verify use of required design mix. — X 951433182'52'419’ 1904.2,
e 1908.2,1908.3
6a. Prior to concrete placement, fabricate specimens ASTM C172
for strength tests, perform slump or slump flow, and air X . ASTM C31 1908.10
content tests, density and determine the temperature of ACI 318: 26.5, ’
the concrete with all results included in the test reports. 26.12
6b. Verify that concrete specimens for strength tests are - ACI 318 26.12 -
maintained in the required initial curing and laboratory X ASTM C31
curing environment, and that the maximum and minimum
temperatures during the initial curing period are reported.
7. Inspect concrete and shotcrete placement for . . 1908.6,
proper application techniques. X ACL 318: 26.5 1908.7,1908.8
8. Verify maintenance of specified curing tem- ACI 318: 26.5.3-
_ — X 1908.9
perature and techniques. 26.5.5
9. Inspect prestressed concrete for:
a. Application of prestressing forces; and X — ACI 318: 26.10 —
b. Grouting of bonded prestressing tendons. X —
10. Inspect erection of precast concrete members. — X ACI 318: 26.9 —
11. Verify in-situ concrete strength, prior to stress-
ing of tendons in post-tensioned concrete and . X ACI 318: 26.11.2 |—
prior to removal of shores and forms from
beams and structural slabs.
12. Inspect formwork for shape, location and .
dimensions of the concrete member bein — X ACI 318: —
9 26.11.1.2(b)

formed.

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm.

a. Where applicable, see Section 1705.12, Special inspections for seismic resistance.

Specific requirements for special inspection shall be included in the research report for the
anchor issued by an approved source in accordance with 17.8.2 in ACI 318, or other
qualification procedures. Where specific requirements are not provided, special inspection

requirements shall be specified by the registered design professional

approved by the building official prior to the commencement of work.

and shall

be



https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.4
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromASTM_RefStdA706_A706M_15
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromASTM_RefStdA706_A706M_15
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromAWS_RefStdD1_4_D1_4M_2011
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1904.1
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1904.2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.3
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromASTM_RefStdC172_C172M_14A
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromASTM_RefStdC31_C31M_15
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.10
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.6
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.7
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.8
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch19_Sec1908.9
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch17_Sec1705.12
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14
https://codes.iccsafe.org/#IBC2018P4_Ch35_PromACI_RefStd318_14

*Add new Table 1704.2 ‘Minimum Special Inspector Qualifications’ to read as follows:

TABLE 1704.2 MINIMUM SPECIAL INSPECTOR QUALIFICATIONS

Category of Testing and Inspection

Minimum Qualifications (refer to key at end of Table)

Shop Testing or

Field Testing or

Review Testing,

Inspection Inspection Certification&
P P Lab Reports
1704.2.5 Inspection of Fabricators
Pre-cast concrete | A, C, E
Structural steel construction | C, F, G
Wood construction | A
Cold formed metal construction | A
1705.2, 1705.10, 1705.11& 1705.12 Steel Construction
Verification of welding consumables, filler metals, CF
procedure specifications, procedure qualification records
and personnel performance qualification records
Nondestructive testing of welding | G G
Inspection of welding | C, F CF
Verification of fabricator and erector documents as listed A C
in AISC 360, chapter N, paragraph 3.2
Material verification of weld filler materials C,F
Inspection of high strength bolting and steel frame joint
details A, C
Inspection of embedment A, C,F
Inspection of steel elements of composite construction A, C,F
Verification of reinforcing steel, cold formed steel deck
and truss materials A, CF
Inspection of reinforcing steel, cold formed steel deck
and trusses A, C
1705.3 & 1705.12 Concrete Construction
Reinforcing placement, cast-in-place bolts, post installed
anchors concrete and shotcrete placement and curing
operations. Inspection of formwork for shape, location A, CH
and dimensions
Pre-stressing steel installation A,C,D,E
Erection of pre-cast concrete members A,C,H
Concrete field sampling and field testing AsJ
Concrete strength testing P
Review certified mill reports A, C
Verify use of required design mix A,LLLLH,C
Pre-stressed (pre-tensioned) concrete force application | A C, E
Post-tensioned concrete force application A,C,D

Review of in-situ concrete strength, prior to stressing of




IBC APPENDIX P
TALL MASS TIMBER BUILDINGS

Normal Text — Matches the 2018 IBC
Underlined Text — Matches the 2021 IBC

Blue Text — Added by Georgia

P101
GENERAL

P101.1 Purpose. The purpose of this appendix is to provide criteria for three new mass timber
construction types: Type IV-A, Type IV-B, and Type IV-C. These building types expand the allowable use
of mass timber construction to larger areas and greater heights than allowed for Type IV-HT
construction.

P101.2 Scope. The provisions in this appendix shall be permitted to be used in addition to or in lieu of
replace the corresponding sections in the 2018 International Building Code, and shall be mandatory
where Types IV-A, IV-B, and IV-C construction are used. Where building Types IV-A, IV-B, or IV-C are not
used, this appendix does not apply.

P102
AMENDMENTS TO THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

CHAPTER 1
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Add new text as follows:

110.3.5 Type IV-A, IV-B and IV-C connection protection inspection. In buildings of Type IV-A IV-B
and IV-C Construction where connection fire resistance ratings are provided by wood cover calculated to
meet the requirements of Section 2304.10.1 inspection of the wood cover shall be made after the cover is
installed but before any other coverings or finishes are installed.

CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

Add new text as follows:
MASS TIMBER. Structural elements of Type IV construction primarily of solid, built-up, panelized or
engineered wood products that meet minimum cross section dimensions of Type IV construction.

Page 1 of 21



NONCOMBUSTIBLE PROTECTION (FOR MASS TIMBER). Noncombustible material, in accordance with
Section 703.5, designed to increase the fire-resistance rating and delay the combustion of mass timber.

Revise as follows:
[BS] WALL, LOAD-BEARING. Any wall meeting either of the following classifications:
1. Any metal or wood stud wall that supports more than 100 pounds per linear foot (1459 N/m) of
vertical load in addition to its own weight.
2. Any masonry,-er concrete, or mass timber wall that supports more than 200 pounds per linear
foot (2919 N/m) of vertical load in addition to its own weight.

CHAPTER 4
SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON OCCUPANCY AND USE

Revise as follows:

[F] 403.3.2 Water supply to required fire pumps. In all buildings that are more than 420 feet (128 m) in
building height, and buildings of Type IV-A and IV-B construction that are more than 120 feet in building
height, required fire pumps shall be supplied by connections to not fewer than two water mains located
in different streets. Separate supply piping shall be provided between each connection to the water
main and the pumps. Each connection and the supply piping between the connection and the pumps
shall be sized to supply the flow and pressure required for the pumps to operate.

Exception: Two connections to the same main shall be permitted provided that the main is valved
such that an interruption can be isolated so that the water supply will continue without interruption
through not fewer than one of the connections.

CHAPTER 5
GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHT AND AREAS

Revise as follows:

TABLE 504.3
ALLOWABLE BUILDING HEIGHT IN FEET ABOVE GRADE PLANE?
TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION

25:;7:2':;0'\' SEE TYPE | TYPEIl | TYPE Il TYPE IV TYPEV
FOOTNOTES | A | B A B A B A B C |HT| A B

NSP UL |160| 65 | 55 | 65 | 55| 65 | 65 | 65| 65 | 50 | 40

ABEFRMSU S UL | 180 | 85 | 75 |85 | 75 |270|180| 85|85 | 70 | 60

c,d

H-1, H-2, H-3, H-5 25 UL | 160 | 65 | 55 | 65 | 55 | 120 | 90 | 65 | 65 | 50 | 40
-4 NSed UL |160| 65 | 55 | 65 | 55| 65 | 65 | 65| 65 | 50 | 40
S UL | 180 | 85 | 75 |85 | 751|140 |100| 8 | 8 | 70 | 60

-1 Condition 1. I-3 NSee UL |160| 65 | 55 | 65| 55| 65 | 65 | 65 | 65 | 50 | 40
! S UL |180| 85 | 75 | 85| 75| 180|120 | 8 | 8 | 70 | 60

" NSdef UL | 160 | 65

I-1 Condition 2, I-2 S UL | 180 | 85 55|65 |55| 65 | 65 | 65| 65|50 40
-4 NS9e UL |160| 65 | 55 | 65| 55| 65 | 65 | 65 | 65 | 50 | 40

Page 2 of 21



S UL|180| 85|75 |85 |75 |180]120| 85 | 85 | 70 | 60
NS¢ UL|160 | 65 | 55|65 |55 65 | 65 | 65|65 | 50 | 40
R 513D 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 50 | 40
S13R 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60 | 60
S UL 180 | 85|75 |85 |75 270 180| 85 | 85 | 70 | 60

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm

UL = Unlimited; NS = Buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system; S =
Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1; S13R = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.2; S13D = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3.

a. See Chapters 4 and 5 for specific exceptions to the allowable heights in the chapter.
b. See Section 903.2 for the minimum thresholds for protection by an automatic sprinkler system
for specific occupancies.

c. New Group H occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.2.5

d. The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building height in accordance with the

International Existing Building Code.

e. New Group I-1 and I-3 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. For new Group I-1 occupancies Condition 1, see
Exception 1 of Section 903.2.6.

f. New and existing Group I-2 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler

system in accordance with Section 903.2.6 and Section 1103.5 of the International Fire Code.
For new Group I-4 occupancies, see Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section 903.2.6.
New Group R occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in

= @

accordance with Section 903.2.8.

Revise as follows:

TABLE 504.4
ALLOWABLE NUMBER OF STORIES ABOVE GRADE PLANE>®
TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION
OCCUPANCY

CLASSIFICATION SEE TYPEI | TYPEN | TYPEI TYPE IV TYPEV
FOOTNOTES | A [ B | A [ B | A [ B|A|B|]C|HT|A]|B

Al NS uL |5 32323333 ]2]1
S uL |6 |43 ]a|[3]aolse]|a]|a]s3]2

A2 NS uL (12| 32323333 ]2]1
S UL |12 4| 3|4 |3 [18]122]6] 4] 3]2

A3 NS uL (12| 32323 ]3][3]|3]2]1
S UL |12 4| 3| 4|3 [18]12]6] 4] 3|2

Ad NS uL (12| 3] 2323333 ]2]1
S UL |12 4 | 3|4 |3 [18]122]6]| 4] 3]2

AS NS uL fucjucjucflouefuou] 2] 2] 2o ]u]|u
S uL fuLjutjucflour oo ue|ue] o |u|ul

8 NS uL| 11|53 [s |3 |55 |55 ]3]2
S UL |12 6 | 4|6 | 418|129 ] 6 | 4]3

Page 3 of 21




(NN OO ONT| i 234334wz1231234344344334433443445
Nt (NN |O| N 456345W212334454545 <t N <t nitinit|(un
onl| <tl| onll wnl| wnl| il S| | =il i enl] st il @] i enlf <til ol S| | S| il i ool enlf sti| o1l <1 [ooll st ool st ;l st |l sl w0l
onl| I onl| 1wl ool S| il il il enl] st1| ol S il el stif SIS <t S| ol il il enff ol stif ool s [N s [N s [ s [ S st~ <] o
onl| ol enll S wol| N S| 1| 1| il et i ol colf if entl 1| S| S| i S| S| i Sl ol 1| N s (R < (R s (R w1 [ R] < Sf |
Nt n(F|t(wn| N 456345W212334454545 <t N <t nomnit|t(in
NN N [<T| i 234334W211223234545 < [Tp} < nmaoaNmn o<
Nt tF(NN|[O| o 456345W32323344545445 < T} < nit|ninlio
wlo|IYN YN «— ™ © [N s [0S ZQ|t ||t |wvnle|dY DYDY I YT Y DY TS
5|5|D|5|D|D 5 S5 DD S5z |3|D|D3|DD2|3|D]D|5 5|5 5|5 5|5 5|5|2(3|D
% n n 2 2 b 3 b = 3 b = 5 wn - |5 - |5 s |12|% s |12|% wn v

o o o o o -
(%) n ninunnunnunununununnunnnunununlunnln wn|2 0|2 niLNM niL "M n wn wn
z z = z zZ 2 2 2 Z Z zl |1Z| Tz |#F ZA ZA Z\RaA Z\RaA = =

i N

c [

.0 .O

= =

© ©

[ c

S| S8

= = < <

1__ | - a3 o 5 L — — ~ I < D D 0 N - o
w oL o T T T T T - - - - 4 = o o @ @ ) )

Page 4 of 21



NS UL | 5 4 2 3 2 4 2 1

u

O (I
o I
[Sa0(F-S

S UL | 6 5 3 4 3 5 3 2

UL = Unlimited; NP = Not Permitted; NS = Buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system; S = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; S13R = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2; S13D = Buildings equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3.

o

See Chapters 4 and 5 for specific exceptions to the allowable height in this chapter.

b. See Section 903.2 for the minimum thresholds for protection by an automatic sprinkler system
for specific occupancies.

c. New Group H occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.2.5.

d. The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building height in accordance with the
International Existing Building Code.

e. New Group I-1 and I-3 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. For new Group I-1 occupancies, Condition 1, see
Exception 1 of Section 903.2.6.

f. New and existing Group I-2 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler

system in accordance with Section 903.2.6 and 1103.5 of the International Fire Code.

For new Group I-4 occupancies, see Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section 903.2.6.

New Group R occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.2.8.

i. Forall I-1 Condition 2, the building shall be protected throughout with an approved automatic

sprinkler system, installed in accordance with NFPA 13 as adopted by the Rules and Regulations

of the Safety Fire Commissioner. No increase in story height shall be permitted.

> @

Revise as follows:

TABLE 506.2
ALLOWABLE AREA FACTOR (A: = NS, S1, S13R, S13D OR SM, as applicable) IN SQUARE FEET*?
OCCUPANCY TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION
CLASSIFICATION SEE TYPE| TYPE Il TYPE Il TYPE IV TYPEV
FOOTNOTES A B A B A B A B C HT A B
NS UL UL 15,500 8,500 14,000 8,500 45,000 | 30,000 18,750 15,000 [ 11,500 | 5,500
Al s1 UL UL 62,000 | 34,000 | 56,000 | 34,000 | 180,000 | 120,000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46,000 [ 22,000
SM UL UL 46,500 | 25500 | 42,000 | 25500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 45000 | 34,500 | 16,500
NS UL UL 15,500 9,500 14,000 9,500 45,000 | 30,000 18,750 15,000 [ 11,500 | 6,000
A2 s1 UL UL 62,000 | 38000 | 56,000 | 38000 | 180,000 | 120,000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46,000 | 24,000
SM uL UL 46,500 | 28500 | 42,000 | 28500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 [ 45000 [ 34,5500 | 18,000
NS UL UL 15,500 9,500 14,000 9,500 45,000 | 30,000 18,750 15,000 | 11,500 | 6,000
A3 s1 UL UL 62,000 | 38000 | 56,000 | 38000 | 180,000 | 120,000 | 75000 | 60,000 | 46,000 | 24,000
SM UL UL 46,500 | 28500 | 42,000 [ 28500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 [ 45000 [ 34,5500 | 18,000
NS UL UL 15,500 9,500 14,000 9,500 45,000 | 30,000 18,750 15,000 | 11,500 | 6,000
A-4 s1 UL UL 62,000 | 38000 | 56,000 | 38000 [ 180,000 | 120,000 | 75,000 | 60,000 | 46,000 [ 24,000
SM UL UL 46,500 | 28,500 | 42,000 | 28500 | 135000 | 90,000 | 56,250 | 45000 | 34,500 | 18,000
NS
A5 s1 uL uL uL uL uL uL uL uL uL uL uL uL
SM
NS UL UL 37,500 | 23,000 | 28,500 19,000 [ 108,000 | 72,000 | 45000 | 36000 | 18,000 [ 9,000
B s1 UL UL 150,000 | 92,000 | 114,000 | 76,000 | 432,000 | 288,000 | 180,000 | 144,000 | 72,000 | 36,000
SM UL UL 112,500 | 69,000 | 85500 | 57,000 | 324,000 | 216,000 | 135000 | 108,000 | 54,000 | 27,000
NS UL UL 26,500 | 14,500 | 23,500 14,500 | 76,500 | 51,000 | 31,875 | 25500 | 18,500 [ 9,500
E s1 UL UL 106,000 | 58,000 | 94,000 | 58,000 | 306,000 | 204,000 | 127,500 | 102,000 | 74,000 | 38,000
SM UL UL 79,500 | 43500 | 70,500 | 43,500 [ 229,500 | 153,000 | 95625 | 76,500 | 55500 [ 28,500
NS UL UL 25,000 | 15,500 19,000 12,000 | 100,500 | 67,000 | 41.875 | 33500 | 14,000 | 8,500
F-1 s1 UL UL 100,000 | 62,000 [ 76,000 | 48000 | 402,000 | 268,000 | 167,500 | 134,000 | 56,000 | 34,000
SM UL UL 75000 | 46,500 | 57,000 | 36,000 | 301,500 | 201,000 | 125625 | 100,500 | 42,000 [ 25,500
NS UL UL 37,500 | 23,000 | 28,500 18,000 | 151,500 | 101,000 | 63,125 | 50,500 | 21,000 | 13,000
F-2 s1 UL UL 150,000 | 92,000 | 114,000 | 72,000 | 606,000 | 404,000 | 252,500 | 202,000 | 84,000 | 52,000
SM UL UL 112,500 | 69,000 | 85500 | 54,000 | 454500 | 303,000 | 189,375 | 151,500 | 63,000 | 39,000
H-1 NS 21,000 | 16,500 11,000 7,000 9,500 7,000 10,500 | 10,500 10,500 10,500 | 7,500 NP

Page 5 of 21




S1
NS¢
H-2 S1 21,000 16,500 11,000 7,000 9,500 7,000 10,500 10,500 10,500 10,500 7,500 3,000
SM
NS¢
H-3 S1 uL 60,000 26,500 14,000 17,500 13,000 25,500 25,500 25,500 25,500 10,000 5,000
SM
NSed UL UL 37,500 17,500 28,500 17,500 72,000 54,000 40,500 36,000 18,000 6,500
H-4 S1 UL UL 150,000 70,000 114,000 70,000 288,000 216,000 162,000 144,000 72,000 26,000
SM UL UL 112,500 52,500 85,500 52,500 216,000 162,000 121,500 108,000 54,000 19,500
NSed UL UL 37,500 23,000 28,500 19,000 72,000 54,000 40,500 36,000 18,000 9,000
H-5 S1 UL UL 150,000 92,000 114,000 76,000 288,000 216,000 162,000 144,000 72,000 36,000
SM UL UL 112,500 69,000 85,500 57,000 216,000 162,000 121,500 108,000 54,000 27,000
NSde UL 55,000 19,000 10,000 16,500 10,000 54,000 36,000 18,000 18,000 10,500 4,500
-1 S1 UL 220,000 76,000 40,000 66,000 40,000 216,000 144,000 72,000 72,000 42,000 18,000
SM UL 165,000 57,000 30,000 49,500 30,000 162,000 108,000 54,000 54,000 31,500 13,500
NSaf UL UL 15,000 11,000 12,000 NP 36,000 24,000 12,000 12,000 9,500 NP
-2 S1 UL UL 60,000 44,000 48,000 NP 144,000 96,000 48,000 48,000 38,000 NP
SM UL UL 45,000 33,000 36,000 NP 108,000 72,000 36,000 36,000 28,500 NP
NSde UL UL 15,000 10,000 10,500 7,500 36,000 24,000 12,000 12,000 7,500 5,000
-3 S1 UL UL 45,000 40,000 42,000 30,000 144,000 96,000 48,000 48,000 30,000 20,000
SM UL UL 45,000 30,000 31,500 22,500 108,000 72,000 36,000 36,000 22,500 15,000
NSd8 UL 60,500 26,500 13,000 23,500 13,000 76,500 51,000 25,500 25,500 18,500 9,000
-4 S1 UL 121,000 106,000 52,000 94,000 52,000 306,000 204,000 102,000 102,000 74,000 36,000
SM UL 181,500 79,500 39,000 70,500 39,000 229,500 153,000 76,500 76,500 55,500 27,000
NS UL UL 21,500 12,500 18,500 12,500 61,500 41,000 25,625 20,500 14,000 9,000
M S1 UL UL 86,000 50,000 74,000 50,000 246,000 164,000 102,500 82,000 56,000 36,000
SM UL UL 64,500 37,500 55,500 37,500 184,500 123,000 76,875 61,500 42,000 27,000
S,\EdR uL uL 24,000 16,000 24,000 16,000 61,500 41,000 25,625 20,500 12,000 7,000
Rt S1 UL UL 96,000 64,000 96,000 64,000 246,000 164,000 102,500 82,000 48,000 28,000
SM UL UL 72,000 48,000 72,000 48,000 184,500 123,000 76,875 61,500 36,000 21,000
S’\g‘; uL uL 24,000 16,000 24,000 16,000 61,500 41,000 25,625 20,500 12,000 7,000
R-2" S1 UL UL 96,000 64,000 96,000 64,000 246,000 164,000 102,500 82,000 48,000 28,000
SM UL UL 72,000 48,000 72,000 48,000 184,500 123,000 76,875 61,500 36,000 21,000
NSd
S$13D
R-3h S13R uL uL uL UL uL uL UL UL UL uL uL uL
S1
SM
NSd
S$13D uL uL 24,000 16,000 24,000 16,000 61,500 41,000 25,625 20,500 12,000 7,000
R-4h S13R
S1 UL UL 96,000 64,000 96,000 64,000 246,000 164,000 102,500 82,000 48,000 28,000
SM UL UL 72,000 48,000 72,000 48,000 184,500 123,000 76,875 61,500 36,000 21,000
NS UL 48,000 26,000 17,500 26,000 17,500 76,500 51,000 31,875 25,500 14,000 9,000
S-1 S1 UL 192,000 104,000 70,000 104,000 70,000 306,000 204,000 127,500 102,000 56,000 36,000
SM UL 144,000 78,000 52,500 78,000 52,500 229,500 153,000 95,625 76,500 42,000 27,000
NS UL 79,000 39,000 26,000 39,000 26,000 115,500 77,000 48,125 38,500 21,000 13,500
S-2 S1 UL 316,000 156,000 104,000 156,000 104,000 462,000 308,000 192,500 154,000 84,000 54,000
SM UL 237,000 117,000 78,000 117,000 78,000 346,500 231,000 144,375 115,500 63,000 40,500
NSi UL 35,500 19,000 8,500 14,000 8,500 54,000 36,000 22,500 18,000 9,000 5,500
U S1 UL 142,000 76,000 34,000 56,000 34,000 216,000 144,000 90,000 72,000 36,000 22,000
SM UL 106,500 57,000 25,500 42,000 25,500 162,000 108,000 67,500 54,000 27,000 16,500

For SlI: 1 square foot = 0.0929 m?.

UL = Unlimited; NP = Not Permitted; NS = Buildings not equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system; S1 = Buildings a maximum of one story above grade plane equipped throughout with

an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; SM = Buildings two or

more stories above grade plane equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1; S13R = Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2; S13D = Buildings equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3.

o

See Chapters 4 and 5 for specific exceptions to the allowable height in this chapter.
See Section 903.2 for the minimum thresholds for protection by an automatic sprinkler system
for specific occupancies.

New Group H occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.2.5.

Page 6 of 21




d. The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building area in accordance with the
International Existing Building Code.

e. New Group I-1 and I-3 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with Section 903.2.6. For new Group I-1 occupancies, Condition 1, see
Exception 1 of Section 903.2.6.

f. New and existing Group I-2 occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler

system in accordance with Section 903.2.6 and Section 1103.5 of the International Fire Code.

New Group |-4 occupancies see Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section 903.2.6.

New Group R occupancies are required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in

accordance with Section 903.2.8.

i. The maximum allowable area for a single-story nonsprinklered Group U greenhouse is permitted
to be 9,000 square feet, or the allowable area shall be permitted to comply with Table C102.1 of
Appendix C.

5w

Revise as follows:

508.4.4.1 Construction. Required separations shall be fire barriers constructed in accordance with
Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both, so as to
completely separate adjacent occupancies. Mass timber elements serving as fire barriers or horizontal
assemblies to separate occupancies in Type IV-B or IV-C construction shall be separated from the
interior of the building with an approved thermal barrier consisting of gypsum board that is not less than
12 inch (12.7 mm) in thickness or a material that is tested in accordance with and meets the acceptance
criteria of both the Temperature Transmission Fire Test and the Integrity Fire Test of NFPA 275.

Add new text as follows:

509.4.1.1 Type IV-B and IV-C construction. Where Table 509 specifies a fire-resistance-rated separation,
mass timber elements serving as fire barriers or horizontal assemblies in Type IV-B or IV-C construction
shall be separated from the interior of the incidental use with an approved thermal barrier consisting of
gypsum board that is not less than 12 inch (12.7 mm) in thickness or a material that is tested in
accordance with and meets the acceptance criteria of both the Temperature Transmission Fire Test and
the Integrity Fire Test of NFPA 275.

CHAPTER 6
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

Delete and substitute as follows:
602.4 Type IV. Fype N constructi

Type IV construction is that type of construction in which the building elements are mass timber or

noncombustible materials and have fire resistance ratings in accordance with Table 601. Mass timber
elements shall meet the fire resistance rating requirements of this section based on either the fire
resistance rating of the noncombustible protection, the mass timber, or a combination of both and shall

Page 7 of 21



be determined in accordance with Section 703.2 or 703.3. The minimum dimensions and permitted
materials for building elements shall comply with the provisions of this section and Section 2304.11.
Mass timber elements of Type IV-A, IV-B and IV-C construction shall be protected with noncombustible
protection applied directly to the mass timber in accordance with Sections 602.4.1 through 602.4.3. The
time assigned to the noncombustible protection shall be determined in accordance with Section 703.8
and comply with Section 722.7.

Cross laminated timber shall be labeled as conforming to PRG 320-19 as reference in Section
2303.1.4.

Exterior load bearing walls and nonload-bearing walls shall be mass timber construction, or shall be
of noncombustible construction.

Exception: Exterior load-bearing walls and nonload-bearing walls of Type IV-HT Construction in
accordance with Section 602.4.4.

The interior building elements, including nonload-bearing walls and partitions, shall be of mass
timber construction or of noncombustible construction.

Exception: Interior building elements and nonload-bearing walls and partitions of Type IV-HT
Construction in accordance with Section 602.4.4.

Combustible concealed spaces are not permitted except as otherwise indicated in Sections 602.4.1
through 602.4.4. Combustible stud spaces within light frame walls of Type IV-HT construction shall not
be considered concealed spaces, but shall comply with Section 718.

In buildings of Type IV-A, B, and C, construction with an occupied floor located more than 75 feet
(22 860 mm) above the lowest level of fire department access, up to and including 12 stories or 180 feet
(54 864 mm) above grade plane, mass timber interior exit and elevator hoistway enclosures shall be
protected in accordance with Section 602.4.1.2. In buildings greater than 12 stories or 180 feet (54 864
mm) above grade plane, interior exit and elevator hoistway enclosures shall be constructed of non-
combustible materials.

Add new text as follows:

602.4.1 Type IV-A. Building elements in Type IV-A construction shall be protected in accordance with

Sections 602.4.1.1 through 602.4.1.6. The required fire resistance rating of noncombustible elements
and protected mass timber elements shall be determined in accordance with Section 703.2 or Section
703.3.

602.4.1.1 Exterior protection. The outside face of exterior walls of mass timber construction shall be
protected with noncombustible protection with a minimum assigned time of 40 minutes as
determined in Table 722.7.1(1). Components of the exterior wall covering shall be of
noncombustible material except water resistive barriers having a peak heat release rate of less than
150 kW/m?, a total heat release of less than 20 MJ/m? and an effective heat of combustion of less
than 18 MJ/kg as determined in accordance with ASTM E1354 and having a flame spread index of 25
or less and a smoke-developed index of 450 of less as determined in accordance with ASTM E84 or
UL 723. The ASTM E1354 test shall be conducted on specimens at the thickness intended for use, in
the horizontal orientation and at an incident radiant heat flux of 50 kW/m?.

Page 8 of 21



602.4.1.2 Interior protection. Interior faces of all mass timber elements, including the inside faces of
exterior mass timber walls and mass timber roofs, shall be protected with material complying with
Section 703.5.

602.4.1.2.1 Protection time. Noncombustible protection shall contribute a time equal to or
greater than times assigned in Table 722.7.1(1), but not less than 80 minutes. The use of
materials and their respective protection contributions listed in Table 722.7.1(2) shall be
permitted to be used for compliance with Section 722.7.1.

602.4.1.3 Floors. The floor assembly shall contain a noncombustible material not less than 1 inch (25
mm) in thickness above the mass timber. Floor finishes in accordance with Section 804 shall be
permitted on top of the noncombustible material. The underside of floor assemblies shall be
protected in accordance with 602.4.1.2.

602.4.1.4 Roofs. The interior surfaces of roof assemblies shall be protected in accordance with
Section 602.4.1.2. Roof coverings in accordance with Chapter 15 shall be permitted on the outside
surface of the roof assembly.

602.4.1.5 Concealed spaces. Concealed spaces shall not contain combustibles other than electrical,
mechanical, fire protection, or plumbing materials and equipment permitted in plenums in
accordance with Section 602 of the International Mechanical Code, and shall comply with all
applicable provisions of Section 718. Combustible construction forming concealed spaces shall be
protected in accordance with Sections 602.4.1.2.

602.4.1.6 Shafts. Shafts shall be permitted in accordance with Section 713 and Section 718. Both the
shaft side and room side of mass timber elements shall be protected in accordance with Section
602.4.1.2.

602.4.2 Type IV-B. Building elements in Type IV-B construction shall be protected in accordance with
Sections 602.4.2.1 through 602.4.2.6. The required fire resistance rating of noncombustible elements or
mass timber elements shall be determined in accordance with Section 703.2 or Section 703.3.

602.4.2.1 Exterior protection. The outside face of exterior walls of mass timber construction shall be
protected with non-combustible protection with a minimum assigned time of 40 minutes as
determined in Table 722.7.1(1). Components of the exterior wall covering shall be of
noncombustible material except water resistive barriers having a peak heat release rate of less than
150 kW/m?, a total heat release of less than 20 MJ/m? and an effective heat of combustion of less
than 18 MJ/kg as determined in accordance with ASTM E1354, and having a flame spread index of
25 or less and a smoke-developed index of 450 or less as determined in accordance with ASTM E84
or UL 723. The ASTM E1354 test shall be conducted on specimens at the thickness intended for use,
in the horizontal orientation and at an incident radiant heat flux of 50 kW/m?.

602.4.2.2 Interior protection. Interior faces of all mass timber elements, including the inside face of
exterior mass timber walls and mass timber roofs, shall be protected, as required by this section,
with materials complying with Section 703.5.

Page 9 of 21



602.4.2.2.1 Protection time. Noncombustible protection shall contribute a time equal to or
greater than times assigned in Table 722.7.1(1), but not less than 80 minutes. The use of
materials and their respective protection contributions listed in Table 722.7.1(2) shall be
permitted to be used for compliance with Section 722.7.1.

602.4.2.2.2 Protected area. Interior faces of all mass timber elements, including the inside face
of exterior mass timber walls and mass timber roofs, shall be protected in accordance with
Section 602.4.2.2.1.

Exceptions: Unprotected portions of mass timber ceilings and walls complying with Section
602.4.2.2.4 and the following:

1. Unprotected portions of mass timber ceilings and walls complying with one of the
following:
1.1 Unprotected portions of mass timber ceilings, including attached beams, shall be

permitted and shall be limited to an area equal to 20 percent of the floor area in any
dwelling unit or fire area.

1.2 Unprotected portions of mass timber walls, including attached columns, shall be
permitted and shall be limited to an area equal to 40 percent of the floor area in any
dwelling unit or fire area.

1.3 Unprotected portions of both walls and ceilings of mass timbers, including
attached columns and beams, in any dwelling unit or fire area shall be permitted in
accordance with Section 602.4.2.2.3.

2. Mass timber columns and beams that are not an integral portion of walls or ceilings,
respectively, shall be permitted to be unprotected without restriction of either aggregate
area or separation from one another.

602.4.2.2.3 Mixed unprotected areas. In each dwelling unit or fire area, where both portions of
ceilings and portions of walls are unprotected, the total allowable unprotected area shall be
determined in accordance with Equations 6-1.

(Utc/Uac) + (Utw&aw) < 1 (Equation 6'1)

where:

Ui =  Total unprotected mass timber ceiling areas

U..= Allowable unprotected mass timber ceiling area conforming to Exception 1.1 of Section
602.4.2.2.2.

Uw = Total unprotected mass timber wall areas
Uaw = Allowable unprotected mass timber wall area conforming to Exception 1.2 of Section
602.4.2.2.2.

602.4.2.2.4 Separation distance between unprotected mass timber elements. In each dwelling
unit or fire area, unprotected portions of mass timber walls and ceilings shall be not less than 15
feet (4572 mm) from unprotected portions of other walls and ceilings, measured horizontally
along the ceiling and from other unprotected portions of walls measure horizontally along the
floor.

Page 10 of 21



602.4.2.3 Floors. The floor assembly shall contain a noncombustible material not less than 1 inch (25
mm) in thickness above the mass timber. Floor finishes in accordance with Section 804 shall be
permitted on top of the noncombustible material. The underside of floor assemblies shall be
protected in accordance with Section 602.4.1.2.

602.4.2.4 Roofs. The interior surfaces of roof assemblies shall be protected in accordance with
Section 602.4.2.2 except, in nonoccupiable spaces, they shall be treated as a concealed space with
no portion left unprotected. Roof coverings in accordance with Chapter 15 shall be permitted on the
outside surface of the roof assembly.

602.4.2.5 Concealed spaces. Concealed spaces shall not contain combustibles other than electrical,
mechanical, fire protection, or plumbing materials and equipment permitted in plenums in
accordance with Section 602 of the International Mechanical Code, and shall comply with all
applicable provisions of Section 718. Combustible construction forming concealed spaces shall be
protected in accordance with Section 602.4.1.2.

602.4.2.6 Shafts. Shafts shall be permitted in accordance with Section 713 and Section 718. Both the
shaft side and room side of mass timber elements shall be protected in accordance with Section
602.4.1.2.

602.4.3 Type IV-C. Building elements in Type IV-C construction shall be protected in accordance with
Sections 602.4.3.1 through 602.4.3.6. The required fire resistance rating of building elements shall be
determined in accordance with Section 703.2 or Section 703.3.

602.4.3.1 Exterior protection. The exterior side of walls of combustible construction shall be
protected with noncombustible protection with a minimum assigned time of 40 minutes as
determined in Table 722.7.1(1). Components of the exterior wall covering shall be of
noncombustible material except water resistive barriers having a peak heat release rate of less than
150 kW/m?, a total heat release of less than 20 MJ/m? and an effective heat of combustion of less
than 18 MJ/kg as determined in accordance with ASTM E1354 and having a flame spread index of 25
or less and a smoke-developed index of 450 or less as determined in accordance with ASTM E84 or
UL 723. The ASTM E1354 test shall be conducted on specimens at the thickness intended for use, in
the horizontal orientation and at an incident radiant heat flux of 50 kW/m>.

602.4.3.2 Interior protection. Mass timber elements are permitted to be unprotected.

602.4.3.3 Floors. Floor finishes in accordance with Section 804 shall be permitted on top of the floor
construction.

602.4.3.4 Roofs. Roof coverings in accordance with Chapter 15 shall be permitted on the outside
surface of the roof assembly.

602.4.3.5 Concealed spaces. Concealed spaces shall not contain combustibles other than electrical,
mechanical, fire protection, or plumbing materials and equipment permitted in plenums in
accordance with Section 602 of the International Mechanical Code, and shall comply with all
applicable provisions of Section 718. Combustible construction forming concealed spaces shall be
protected with noncombustible protection with a minimum assigned time of 40 minutes as specified
in Table 722.7.1(1).

Page 11 of 21



602.4.3.6 Shafts. Shafts shall be permitted in accordance with Section 713 and 718. Shafts and
elevator hoistway and interior exit stairway enclosures shall be protected with noncombustible
protection with a minimum assigned time of 40 minutes as specified in Table 722.7.1(1), on both the
inside of the shaft and the outside of the shaft.

602.4.4 Type IV-HT. Type IV-HT (Heavy Timber) construction is that type of construction in which the

exterior walls are of noncombustible materials and the interior building elements are of solid wood,

laminated heavy timber or structural composite lumber (SCL), without concealed spaces. The minimum

dimensions for permitted materials including solid timber, glued-laminated timber, structural composite

lumber (SCL) and cross laminated timber (CLT) and details of Type IV construction shall comply with the

provisions of this section and Section 2304.11. Exterior walls complying with Section 602.4.4.1 or

602.4.4.2 shall be permitted. Interior walls and partitions not less than 1-hour fire resistance rating or

heavy timber conforming with Section 2304.11.2.2 shall be permitted.

Revise as follows:

602:4-1602.4.4.1 Fire-retardant-treated wood in exterior walls. Fire-retardant-treated wood
framing and sheathing complying with Section 2303.2 shall be permitted within exterior wall
assemblies not less than 6 inches (152 mm) in thickness with a 2-hour rating or less.

602.4.2602.4.4.2 Cross-laminated timber in exterior walls. Cross-laminated timber complying with
Section 2303.1.4 shall be permitted within exterior wall assemblies not less than 6 inches (152 mm)
in thickness with a 2-hour rating or less, provided the exterior surface of the cross-laminated timber
is protected by one of the following:

1. Fire-retardant-treated wood sheathing complying with Section 2303.2 and not less than /3,
inch (12 mm) thick; or

2. Gypsum board not less than /, inch (12.7 mm) thick; or

3. A noncombustible material.

602:4-3602.4.4.3 Exterior structural members. Where a horizontal separation of 20 feet (6096 mm)
or more is provided, wood columns and arches conforming to heavy timber sizes complying with
Section 2304.11 shall be permitted to be used externally.

TABLE 601
FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDING ELEMENTS (HOURS)
BUILDING TYPEI | TYPEN | TYPEI TYPE IV TYPEV
ELEMENT A|B|A[B|A[B|A[B|C]|] HT |A]B
Primary
structural 3 {22 1t | 0 | 12| 0 |3 |22 2 HT 1t | 0

framef (see
Section 202)

Bearing walls
Exterior®f 3 2 1 0 2 2
Interior 32 28 1 0 1 0

Jw |w
IN IN
IN N

1/HT 1 0

Page 12 of 21



Nonbearing
walls and
partitions
Exterior

See Table 602

Nonbearing
walls and
partitions
Interior

See
Section 0 0
2304.11.2

Floor
construction
and
associated 2 2 1 0 1 0
secondary
members (see
Section 202)

HT 1 0

IN
1IN
IN

Roof
construction
and
associated
secondary
members (see
Section 202)

1 %P 0°¢ HT

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Roof supports: Fire-resistance ratings of primary structural frame and bearing walls are
permitted to be reduced by 1 hour where supporting a roof only.

b. Exceptin Group F-1, H, M and S-1 occupancies, fire protection of structural members in
roof construction shall not be required, including protection of primary structural frame
members, roof framing and decking where every part of the roof construction is 20 feet
or more above any floor immediately below. Fire-retardant-treated wood members
shall be allowed to be used for such unprotected members.

c. Inall occupancies, heavy timber complying with Section 2304.11 shall be allowed where
a 1-hour or less fire-resistance rating is required.

d. Not less than the fire-resistance rating required by other sections of this code.

e. Not less than the fire-resistance rating based on fire separation distance (see Table 602).

f. Not less than the fire-resistance rating as referenced in Section 704.10.

TABLE 602
FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING REQUIREMENTS FOR EXTERIOR WALLS BASED ON FIRE SEPARATION
DISTANCE %8

FIRE TYPE OF OCCUPANCY OCCUPANCY OCCUPANCY
SEPARATION CONSTRUCTION | GROUP H¢ GROUP F-1, M, | GROUP A, B, E,
DISTANCE = X s-1f F-2,1,R,S-2,
(feet) u"

X < 5° All 3 2 1

Page 13 of 21




5<X<10 IA, IV-A 3 2 1
Others 2 1 1
10<X<30 IA, IB, IV-A, IV-B 2 1 1°
11B, VB 1 0 0
Others 1 1 1°
All 0 0 0

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Load-bearing exterior walls shall also comply with the fire-resistance rating
requirements of Table 601.

See Section 706.1.1 for party walls.

Open parking garages complying with Section 406 shall not be required to have a
fire-resistance rating.

The fire-resistance rating of an exterior wall is determined based upon the fire
separation distance of the exterior wall and the story in which the wall is located.
For special requirements for Group H occupancies, see Section 415.6.

For special requirements for Group S aircraft hangers, see Section 412.3.1.

Where Table 705.8 permits nonbearing exterior walls with unlimited area of
unprotected openings, the required fire-resistance rating for the exterior walls is 0
hours.

For a building containing only a Group U occupancy private garage or carport, the
exterior wall shall not be required to have a fire-resistance rating where the fire
separation distance is 5 feet (1523 mm) or greater.

For a Group R-3 building of Type II-B or Type V-B construction, the exterior wall shall
not be required to have a fire-resistance rating where the fire separation distance is
5 feet (1523 mm) or greater.

CHAPTER 7
FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES

Add new text as follows:
703.8 Determination of noncombustible protection time contribution. The time, in minutes,

contributed to the fire resistance rating by the noncombustible protection of mass timber building

elements, components, or assemblies, shall be established through a comparison of assemblies tested

using procedures set forth in ASTM E119 or UL263. The test assemblies shall be identical in construction,

loading, and materials, other than the noncombustible protection. The two test assemblies shall be

tested to the same criteria of structural failure with the following conditions:

1.
2.

Test Assembly 1 shall be without protection.

Test Assembly 2 shall include the representative noncombustible protection. The protection

shall be fully defined in terms of configuration details, attachment details, joint sealing details,

accessories and all other relevant details.

The noncombustible protection time contribution shall be determined by subtracting the fire

resistance time, in minutes, of Test Assembly 1 from the fire resistance time, in minutes, of Test

Assembly 2.

Page 14 of 21




Add new text as follows:
703.9 Sealing of adjacent mass timber elements. In buildings of Type IV-A, 1V-B, and IV-C construction,

sealant or adhesive shall be provided to resist the passage of air in the following locations:

1.

At abutting edges and intersections of mass timber building elements required to be fire-
resistance rated.

At abutting intersections of mass timber building elements and building elements of other
materials where both are required to be fire-resistance rated.

Sealants shall meet the requirements of ASTM C920. Adhesives shall meet the requirements of

ASTM D3498.

Exception: Sealants or adhesives need not be provided where they are not a required component of

a tested fire-resistance-rated assembly.

Revise as follows:

705.2.3.1 Balconies and similar projections. Balconies and similar projections of combustible
construction other than fire-retardant-treated wood shall be fire-resistance rated where required by
Table 601 for floor construction or shall be of heavy timber construction in accordance with Section
2304.11. The aggregate length of the projections shall not exceed 50 percent of the building’s perimeter
on each floor.

Exceptions:

1. On buildings of Types | and Il construction, three stories or less above grade plane, fire-
retardant-treated wood shall be permitted for balconies, porches, decks and exterior stairways
not used as required exits.

2. Untreated wood and plastic composites that comply with ASTM D7032 and Section 2612 are
permitted for pickets, rails and similar guard components that are limited to 42 inches (1067
mm) in height.

3. Balconies and similar projections on buildings of Types lll, IV-HT and V construction shall be
permitted to be of Type V construction and shall not be required to have a fire-resistance rating
where sprinkler protection is extended to these areas.

4. Where sprinkler protection is extended to the balcony areas, the aggregate length of the
balcony on each floor shall not be limited.

Revise as follows:
718.2.1 Fireblocking materials. Fireblocking shall consists of the following materials:

1. Two-inch (51 mm) nominal lumber.

2. Two thicknesses of 1-inch (25 mm) nominal lumber with broken lap joints.

Page 15 of 21



3. One thickness of 0.719-inch (18.3 mm) wood structural panels with joints backed by 0.719-inch

(18.3 mm) wood structural panels.

4. One thickness of 0.75-inch (19.1 mm) particleboard with joints backed by 0.75-inch (19 mm)

particleboard.

5. One-half-inch (12.7 mm) gypsum board.

6. One-fourth-inch (6.4 mm) cement-based millboard.

7. Batts or blankets of mineral wood, mineral fiber or other approved materials installed in such a

manner as to be securely retained in place.

8. Cellulose insulation installed as tested for the specific application.

9. Mass timber complying with Section 2304.11.

Add new text as follows:

722.7 Fire resistance rating of mass timber. The required fire resistance of mass timber elements in

Section 602.4 shall be determined in accordance with Section 703.2 or Section 703.3. The fire resistance

rating of building elements shall be as required in Tables 601 and 602 and as specified elsewhere in this

code. The fire resistance rating of the mass timber elements shall consist of the fire resistance of the

unprotected element added to the protection time of the noncombustible protection.

722.7.1 Minimum required protection. Where required by Sections 602.4.1 through 602.4.3,

noncombustible protection shall be provided for mass timber building elements in accordance with

Table 722.7.1(1). The rating, in minutes, contributed by the noncombustible protection of mass

timber building elements, components, or assemblies, shall be established in accordance with

Section 703.8. The protection contributions indicated in Table 722.7.1(2) shall be deemed to comply

with this requirement where installed and fastened in accordance with Section 722.7.2.

TABLE 722.7.1(1)

PROTECTION REQUIRED FROM NONCOMBUSTIBLE COVERING MATERIAL

REQUIRED FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING OF BUILDING

ELEMENT PER TABLE 601 AND TABLE 602 (hours)

MINIMUM PROTECTION REQUIRED FROM
NONCOMBUSTIBLE PROTECTION (minutes)

1 40
2 80
3 or more 120

TABLE 722.7.1(2)

PROTECTION PROVIDED BY NONCOMBUSTIBLE COVERING MATERIAL

NONCOMBUSTIBLE PROTECTION

PROTECTION CONTRIBUTION (minutes)

1/,-inch Type X gypsum board

25

5/g-inch Type X gypsum board

40

722.7.2 Installation of gypsum board noncombustible protection. Gypsum board complying with

Table 722.7.1(2) shall be installed in accordance with this section.

Page 16 of 21




722.7.2.1 Interior surfaces. Layers of Type X gypsum board serving as noncombustible

protection for interior surfaces of wall and ceiling assemblies determined in accordance with

Table 722.7.1(1) shall be installed in accordance with the following:

1.

Each layer shall be attached with Type S drywall screws of sufficient length to penetrate
the mass timber at least 1-inch (25 mm) when driven flush with the paper surface of the

gypsum board.

Exception: The third layer, where determined necessary by Section 722.7, shall be
permitted to be attached with 1-inch (25 mm) No. 6 Type S drywall screws to furring
channels in accordance with AlSI S220.

Screws for attaching the base layer shall be 12 inches (305 mm) on center in both
directions.

Screws for each layer after the base layer shall be 12 inches (305 mm) on center in both
directions and offset from the screws of the previous layers by 4 inches (102 mm) in
both directions.

All panel edges of any layer shall be offset 18 inches (457 mm) from those of the
previous layer.

All panel edges shall be attached with screws sized and offset as in Items 1 through 4
and placed at least 1 inch (25 mm) but not more than 2 inches (51 mm) from the panel

edge.

All panels installed at wall-to-ceiling intersections shall be installed such that ceiling
panels are installed first and the wall panels are installed after the ceiling panel has been
installed and is fitted tight to the ceiling panel. Where multiple layers are required, each
layer shall repeat this process.

All panels installed at a wall-to-wall intersection shall be installed such that the panels
covering an exterior wall or a wall with a greater fire resistance rating shall be installed
first and the panels covering the other wall shall be fitted tight to the panel covering the
first wall. Where multiple layers are required, each layer shall repeat this process.

Panel edges of the face layer shall be taped and finished with joint compound. Fastener
heads shall be covered with joint compound.

Panel edges protecting mass timber elements adjacent to unprotected mass timber
elements in accordance with Section 602.4.2.2 shall be covered with 1 %-inch (32 mm)
metal corner bead and finished with joint compound.

722.7.2.2 Exterior surfaces. Layers of Type X gypsum board serving as noncombustible

protection for the outside of the exterior mass timber walls determined in accordance with

Table 722.7.1(1) shall be fastened 12 inches (305 mm) on center each way and 6 inches (152

mm) on center at all joints or ends. All panel edges shall be attached with fasteners located at

least 1 inch (25 mm) but not more than 2 inches (51 mm) from the panel edge. Fasteners shall

comply with one of the following:

1.

Galvanized nails of minimum 12 gage with a 7/16-inch (11 mm) inch head of sufficient
length to penetrate the mass timber a minimum of 1 inch (25 mm).

Page 17 of 21



2. Screws which comply with ASTM C1002 (Type S, W, or G) of sufficient length to
penetrate the mass timber a minimum of 1 inch (25 mm).

CHAPTER 14
EXTERIOR WALLS

Revise as follows:

1405.1.1 Types |, I1, lll and IV-HT construction. On buildings of Types |, II, [l and IV-HT construction,
exterior wall coverings shall be permitted to be constructed of combustible materials, complying with
the following limitations:

1. Combustible exterior wall coverings shall not exceed 10 percent of an exterior wall surface area
where the fire separation distance is 5 feet (1524 mm) or less.

2. Combustible exterior wall coverings shall be limited to 40 feet (12 192 mm) in height above grade
plane.

3. Combustible exterior wall coverings constructed of fire-retardant-treated wood complying with
Section 2303.2 for exterior installation shall not be limited in wall surface area where the fire
separation distance is 5 feet (1524 mm) or less and shall be permitted up to 60 feet (18 288 mm) in
height above grade plane regardless of the fire separation distance.

4. Wood veneers shall comply with Section 1404.5.
CHAPTER 17
SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS

Add new text as follows:
1705.5.3 Mass Timber construction. Special inspections of mass timber elements in Types IV-A, IV-B and
IV-C construction shall be in accordance with Table 1705.5.3.

Add new table as follows:

TABLE 1705.5.3
REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTION OF MASS TIMBER CONSTRUCTION

Page 18 of 21



CONTINUQUS PERIODIC

TYPE SPECIAL INSPECTION | SPECIAL INSPECTION

1 Inspection of anchorage and connections of mass timber construction to timber deep X
‘ foundation systems. -

2. | Inspect erection of mass timber construction. — X
3 Inspection of connections where installation methods are required to meet design loads.
Verify use of proper installation equipment. — X
Verify use of pre-drilled holes where required. — X
Threaded fasteners i o q
Inspect serews, including diameter, length, head
type, spacing, installation angle and depth.
Adhesive anchors installed in horizontal or upwardly inclined orientation to resist x
sustained tension loads. -
Adhesive anchors not defined in preceding cell. — X
Bolted connections. — X
Concealed connections. — X

Add new text as follows:

1705.19 Sealing of mass timber Periodic special inspections of sealants or adhesives shall be conducted
where sealant or adhesive required by Section 703.9 is applied to mass timber building elements as
designated in the approved construction documents.

CHAPTER 23
WOOD

Add new text as follows:
2304.10.1 Connection fire-resistance rating. Fire resistance ratings for connectionsin Type IV-A, 1V-B,
or IV-C construction shallbe determined by one of the following:

1. Testing in accordance with Section 703.2 where the connection is part of the fire resistance
test.

2. Engineering analysis that demonstrates that the temperature rise at any portion of the connection is
limited to an average temperature rise of 250°F (139° C), and a maximum temperature rise of 325°F
(181° C), for a time corresponding to the required fire resistance rating of the structural element
being connected. For the purposes of this analysis, the connectionincludes connectors, fasteners,
and portions of wood members included in the structural design of the connection.

CHAPTER 31
SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION

Revise as follows:

3102.3 Type of construction. Noncombustible membrane structures shall be classified as Type |l B
construction. Noncombustible frame or cable-supported structures covered by an approved membrane
in accordance with Section 3102.3.1 shall be classified as Type Il B construction. Heavy timber frame-
supported structures covered by an approved membrane in accordance with Section 3102.3.1 shall be

Page 19 of 21



classified as Type IV-HT construction. Other membrane structures shall be classified as Type V
construction.

Exception: Plastic less than 30 feet (9144 mm) above any floor used in greenhouses, where
occupancy by the general public is not authorized, and for aquaculture pond covers is not required
to meet the fire propagation performance criteria of Test Method 1 or Test Method 2, as
appropriate, of NFPA 701.

Revise as follows:

3102.6.1.1 Membrane. A membrane meeting the fire propagation performance criteria of Test Method
1 or Test Method 2, as appropriate, of NFPA 710 shall be permitted to be used as the roof or as a
skylight on buildings of Type Il B, I, IV-HT and V construction, provided that the membrane is not less
than 20 feet (6096 mm) above and floor, balcony or gallery.

CHAPTER 35
REFERENCED STANDARDS

Revise as follows:

APA APA — Engineered Wood Association
7011 South 19" Street
Tacoma WA 98466-7400

ANSI/APA PRG 320 — 1#19: Standard for Performance-rated Cross-laminated Timber
602.4, 2303.1.4

Add new text as follows:

ASTM ASTM International
100 Barr Harbor Drive, P.O. Box C700
West Conshohocken PA 19428-2959

D3498—03(2011): Standard Specification for Adhesives for Field-Gluing Plywood to Lumber Framing
for Floor Systems
703.9

AWC American Wood Council
222 Catoctin Circle SE, Suite 201
Leesburg, VA 20175

ANSI/AWC SDPWS-2021: Special Design Provisions for Wind and Seismic

202, 2305.1, 2305.2, 2305.3, 2306.1, 2306.2, 2306.3, Table 2306.3(1), Table 2306.3(3),
2307.1

Page 20 of 21



AWC American Wood Council
222 Catoctin Circle SE, Suite 201
Leesburg, VA 20175

APPENDIX D
FIRE DISTRICTS

Revise as follows:
D102.2.5 Structural fire rating. Walls, floors, roofs and their supporting structural members shall be not
less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction.

Exceptions:
1. Buildings of Type IV-HT construction.

2. Buildings equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1.

3. Automobile parking structures.

4. Buildings surrounded on all sides by a permanently open space of not less than 30 feet
(9144 mm).

5. Partitions complying with Section 603.1, ltem 11.

Page 21 of 21



	Amend Chart 2022 ERB v4
	 Proposed Amendments (added text to the code is: underlined, deleted text to the code is: struck through) 
	 ITEM NUMBER

	Item #12 Table
	Item #14 Table
	Appendix P Tall Mass Timber Buildings

